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Quality Council of India, Institution of Engineers Building, IInd Floor, 2 - Bahadur Shah Zafar Marg, New Delhi - 110002, India.

The Quality Council of India (QCI) is a premier autonomous body set up by the Ministry of 
Commerce and Industry, Government of India jointly with the Indian Industry represented by the 
three premier industry associa�ons: Associated Chambers of Commerce and Industry of India 
(ASSOCHAM), Confedera�on of Indian Industry (CII), and Federa�on of Indian Chambers of 
Commerce and Industry (FICCI). Since its establishment in 1997, QCI has become synonymous with 
promo�on of quality, and a na�onal accredita�on system. It has had an illustrious and inspiring 
lineage of Chairpersons star�ng with Mr. Ratan N. Tata.

Quality Council of India is responsible for crea�ng a Quality mindset and envisions to ensure quality 
across products and services that touches every ci�zen. The vision is aligned with making India a 
developed na�on by 2047 on the founda�on of Aatmanirbhar Bharat. The Secretary General shall 
play a crucial role in upholding the vision and take Quality Mission to the grassroots.

Search-cum-Selec�on Commi�ee is looking for candidate for the posi�on of Secretary General (SG) 
who is an experienced, dynamic, energe�c & passionate individual possessing Master’s Degree 
with proven track record of inspiring teams & building & managing high-impact large-scale 
organiza�ons working closely with government, industry, and society at the na�onal level with 
global linkages. Ini�al offered term is for a period of 5 years.

The SG func�ons as the Principal Chief Execu�ve Officer (CEO) of organiza�on, and has all the 
execu�ve powers to supervise & manage the technical & administra�ve func�ons of the Council. 
The compensa�on for the role can be between Rs.75 to 100 lacs per annum as per qualifica�on & 
experience as well as last drawn salary.

The nomina�ng authority /organiza�ons may send their recommenda�ons with resume of the 
nominated candidate addressed to: (recruitment@qcin.org). In case of nomina�ons, the eligible 
candidates must also apply in online portal, without which the applica�on may not be considered.

More details about the role, requirements, and about QCI can be accessed online here: 
h�ps://qcin.org/work-with-us/#careers.

The last date to apply online / receipt of nomina�ons is 23.10.2023, 05:00 pm.

The candidates who had applied earlier in response to adver�sement dated 29.06.2023, 
01.07.2023 & Employment news- July 15-21, 2023 edi�on, need not apply again.

Note:   The Competent Authority reserves the right to make all appropriate exceptions in order to 
attract and select an outstanding candidate. Further, Competent Authority may reject any or all the 
applications / nominations without assigning any reason.


